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THE FIRST EPISTLE GENERAL
OF JOHN

1 That which was from the beginning, that
which we have heard, that which we have seen
with our eyes, that which we did behold, and our
handsdidhandle, concerning theWordof theLife
—

2 and the Life was manifested, and we have
seen, and do testify, and declare to you the Life,
the age-during, which was with the Father, and
wasmanifested to us—

3 thatwhichwehave seen andhearddeclarewe
to you, that ye also may have fellowship with us,
and our fellowship [is] with the Father, and with
His Son Jesus Christ;

4and these things wewrite to you, that your joy
may be full.

5 And this is the message that we have heard
from Him, and announce to you, that God is light,
and darkness in Him is not at all;

6 ifwemay say— 'we have fellowshipwithHim,'
and in the darknessmaywalk—we lie, and do not
the truth;

7 and if in the light we may walk, as He is in the
light —we have fellowship one with another, and
the blood of Jesus Christ His Son doth cleanse us
from every sin;

8 if wemay say— 'we have not sin,' ourselveswe
lead astray, and the truth is not in us;
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9 if we may confess our sins, stedfast He is and
righteous thatHemay forgiveus the sins, andmay
cleanse us from every unrighteousness;

10 ifwemay say— 'we have not sinned,' a liarwe
make Him, and His word is not in us.

2
1My little children, these things I write to you,

that ye may not sin: and if any one may sin, an
advocate we have with the Father, Jesus Christ, a
righteous one,

2 and he — he is a propitiation for our sins, and
not for ours only, but also for the whole world,

3and in this we know that we have known him,
if his commands wemay keep;

4 he who is saying, 'I have known him,' and his
command is not keeping, a liar he is, and in him
the truth is not;

5 and whoever may keep his word, truly in him
the love of God hath been perfected; in this we
know that in himwe are.

6Hewho is saying in himhe doth remain, ought
according as he walked also himself so to walk.

7 Brethren, a new command I write not to you,
but an old command, that ye had from the begin-
ning— the old command is theword that ye heard
from the beginning;

8 again, a new command I write to you, which
thing is true in him and in you, because the dark-
ness doth pass away, and the true light doth now
shine;

9 he who is saying, in the light he is, and his
brother is hating, in the darkness he is till now;
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10 he who is loving his brother, in the light he
doth remain, and a stumbling-block in him there
is not;

11 and he who is hating his brother, in the dark-
ness he is, and in the darkness he doth walk, and
he hath not known whither he doth go, because
the darkness did blind his eyes.

12 I write to you, little children, because the sins
have been forgiven you through his name;

13 Iwrite toyou, fathers, becauseyehaveknown
him who [is] from the beginning; I write to you,
young men, because ye have overcome the evil. I
write to you, little youths, because ye have known
the Father:

14 I did write to you, fathers, because ye have
known him who [is] from the beginning; I did
write to you, young men, because ye are strong,
and the word of God in you doth remain, and ye
have overcome the evil.

15 Love not ye the world, nor the things in the
world; if any one doth love the world, the love of
the Father is not in him,

16 because all that [is] in the world — the desire
of the flesh, and the desire of the eyes, and the
ostentation of the life— is not of the Father, but of
the world,

17 and the world doth pass away, and the desire
of it, and he who is doing the will of God, he doth
remain— to the age.

18 Little youths, it is the last hour; and even
as ye heard that the antichrist doth come, even
now antichrists have becomemany—whence we
know that it is the last hour;
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19 out of us they went forth, but they were not
of us, for if they had been of us, they would
have remained with us; but — that they might be
manifested that they are not all of us.

20And ye have an anointing from the Holy One,
and have known all things;

21 I did not write to you because ye have not
known the truth, but because ye have known it,
and because no lie is of the truth.

22Who is the liar, except he who is denying that
Jesus is the Christ? this one is the antichristwho is
denying the Father and the Son;

23 every one who is denying the Son, neither
hath he the Father, [he who is confessing the Son
hath the Father also.]

24Ye, then, that which ye heard from the begin-
ning, in you let it remain; if in you may remain
thatwhich from the beginning ye did hear, ye also
in the Son and in the Father shall remain,

25and this is the promise that He did promise us
— the life the age-during.

26 These things I did write to you concerning
those leading you astray;

27 and you, the anointing that ye did receive
from him, in you it doth remain, and ye have no
need that any onemay teach you, but as the same
anointing doth teach you concerning all, and is
true, and is not a lie, and even as was taught you,
ye shall remain in him.

28And now, little children, remain in him, that
when he may be manifested, we may have bold-
ness, and may not be ashamed before him, in his
presence;
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29 if ye know that he is righteous, know ye that
every one doing the righteousness, of him hath
been begotten.

3
1 See ye what love the Father hath given to us,

that children of God wemay be called; because of
this theworld dothnot knowus, because it did not
knowHim;

2 beloved, now, children of God are we, and it
was not yet manifested what we shall be, and we
haveknown that if hemaybemanifested, likehim
we shall be, because we shall see him as he is;

3and every onewho is having this hope on him,
doth purify himself, even as he is pure.

4Everyonewho is doing the sin, the lawlessness
also he doth do, and the sin is the lawlessness,

5 and ye have known that he was manifested
that our sins he may take away, and sin is not in
him;

6 every one who is remaining in him doth not
sin; every one who is sinning, hath not seen him,
nor known him.

7 Little children, let no one lead you astray; he
who is doing the righteousness is righteous, even
as he is righteous,

8 he who is doing the sin, of the devil he is,
because from the beginning the devil doth sin; for
this was the Son of God manifested, that he may
break up the works of the devil;

9 every one who hath been begotten of God, sin
he doth not, because his seed in him doth remain,
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and he is not able to sin, because of God he hath
been begotten.

10 In this manifest are the children of God, and
the children of the devil; every one who is not
doing righteousness, is not of God, and he who is
not loving his brother,

11 because this is the message that ye did hear
fromthebeginning, thatwemay loveoneanother,

12 not as Cain — of the evil one he was, and he
did slay his brother, and wherefore did he slay
him? becausehisworkswereevil, and thoseofhis
brother righteous.

13Donotwonder,mybrethren, if theworlddoth
hate you;

14 we — we have known that we have passed
out of the death to the life, because we love the
brethren; he who is not loving the brother doth
remain in the death.

15Every one who is hating his brother— aman-
killer he is, and ye have known that noman-killer
hath life age-during in him remaining,

16 in this we have known the love, because he
for us his life did lay down, and we ought for the
brethren the lives to lay down;

17 and whoever may have the goods of the
world, andmayviewhisbrotherhavingneed, and
may shut up his bowels from him — how doth the
love of God remain in him?

18 My little children, may we not love in word
nor in tongue, but in word and in truth!

19 and in this we know that of the truth we are,
and before Himwe shall assure our hearts,

20because if our heartmay condemn— because
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greater is God than our heart, and He doth know
all things.

21Beloved, if our heartmaynot condemnus,we
have boldness toward God,

22 and whatever we may ask, we receive from
Him, because His commands we keep, and the
things pleasing before Himwe do,

23and this is His command, thatwemay believe
in the name of His Son Jesus Christ, and may love
one another, even as He did give command to us,

24and hewho is keepingHis commands, in Him
he doth remain, and He in him; and in this we
know that He doth remain in us, from the Spirit
that He gave us.

4
1 Beloved, every spirit believe not, but prove

the spirits, if of God they are, because many false
prophets have gone forth to the world;

2 in this know ye the Spirit of God; every spirit
that doth confess Jesus Christ in the flesh having
come, of God it is,

3 and every spirit that doth not confess Jesus
Christ in the flesh having come, of God it is not;
and this is that of the antichrist, which ye heard
that it doth come, and now in the world it is
already.

4Ye — of God ye are, little children, and ye have
overcome them; because greater is He who [is] in
you, than he who is in the world.

5 They — of the world they are; because of this
from the world they speak, and the world doth
hear them;
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6 we — of God we are; he who is knowing God
doth hear us; he who is not of God, doth not hear
us; from this we know the spirit of the truth, and
the spirit of the error.

7Beloved,maywe loveoneanother, because the
love is of God, and every onewho is loving, of God
he hath been begotten, and doth know God;

8hewho isnot lovingdidnotknowGod, because
God is love.

9 In this was manifested the love of God in us,
because His Son — the only begotten — hath God
sent to the world, that wemay live through him;

10 in this is the love, not that we loved God,
but that He did love us, and did send His Son a
propitiation for our sins.

11Beloved, if thus didGod love us,we also ought
one another to love;

12Godnoonehath ever seen; ifwemay love one
another, God in us doth remain, and His love is
having been perfected in us;

13 in this we know that in Him we do remain,
and He in us, because of His Spirit He hath given
us.

14Andwe—wehave seenanddo testify, that the
Father hath sent the Son— Saviour of the world;

15whoever may confess that Jesus is the Son of
God, God in him doth remain, and he in God;

16 and we — we have known and believed the
love, that God hath in us; God is love, and he who
is remaining in the love, in God he doth remain,
and God in him.

17 In this made perfect hath been the love with
us, that boldness we may have in the day of the
judgment, because even asHe is, we—we also are
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in this world;
18 fear isnot in the love, but theperfect lovedoth

cast out the fear, because the fear hath punish-
ment, and he who is fearing hath not been made
perfect in the love;

19we—we lovehim, becauseHe—Hefirst loved
us;

20 if any one may say — 'I love God,' and his
brother he may hate, a liar he is; for he who is
not loving his brother whom he hath seen, God —
whom he hath not seen— how is he able to love?

21 and this [is] the command we have from
Him, that he who is loving God, may also love his
brother.

5
1 Every one who is believing that Jesus is the

Christ, of God he hath been begotten, and every
one who is loving Him who did beget, doth love
also himwho is begotten of Him:

2 in this we know that we love the children of
God, when we may love God, and His commands
may keep;

3 for this is the love of God, that His commands
wemay keep, and His commands are not burden-
some;

4because every onewho is begotten ofGoddoth
overcome the world, and this is the victory that
did overcome the world— our faith;

5who is he who is overcoming the world, if not
he who is believing that Jesus is the Son of God?

6Thisone ishewhodidcome throughwaterand
blood— Jesus the Christ, not in thewater only, but
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in the water and the blood; and the Spirit it is that
is testifying, because the Spirit is the truth,

7 because three are who are testifying [in the
heaven, the Father, theWord, and the Holy Spirit,
and these— the three— are one;

8 and three are who are testifying in the earth],
the Spirit, and the water, and the blood, and the
three are into the one.

9 If the testimony of men we receive, the testi-
mony of God is greater, because this is the testi-
mony of God that He hath testified concerningHis
Son.

10 He who is believing in the Son of God, hath
the testimony in himself; he who is not believing
God, a liar hath made Him, because he hath not
believed in the testimony that God hath testified
concerning His Son;

11 and this is the testimony, that life age-during
did God give to us, and this — the life — is in His
Son;

12hewho ishaving the Son, hath the life; hewho
is not having the Son of God— the life he hath not.

13 These things I did write to you who are be-
lieving in the name of the Son of God, that ye may
knowthat life yehaveage-during, and that yemay
believe in the name of the Son of God.

14And this is the boldness that we have toward
Him, that if anything wemay ask according to his
will, He doth hear us,

15 and if we have known that He doth hear us,
whatever we may ask, we have known that we
have the requests that we have requested from
Him.

16 If any one may see his brother sinning a sin



1 John 5:17 xi 1 John 5:21

not unto death, he shall ask, and He shall give to
him life to those sinning not unto death; there is
sin to death, not concerning it do I speak that he
may beseech;

17all unrighteousness is sin, and there is sin not
unto death.

18Wehaveknownthat everyonewhohathbeen
begotten of God doth not sin, but he who was
begotten of God doth keep himself, and the evil
one doth not touch him;

19we have known that of God we are, and the
whole world in the evil doth lie;

20 and we have known that the Son of God is
come, and hath given us a mind, that we may
know Him who is true, and we are in Him who is
true, in His Son Jesus Christ; this one is the true
God and the life age-during!

21 Little children, guard yourselves from the
idols! Amen.
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